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Real Housewives of New Jersey television star Melissa Gorga shows you how to love your man and keep
him happy, satisfied, faithful, and devoted to you.

What you see is what you get with Melissa Gorga. On Real Housewives of New Jersey, she's that beautiful,
ambitious woman with a successful career who puts her family first. In fact, her stable yet sexy marriage to
lovable Joe is a welcome antidote to the constant fighting and backbiting on the show. Despite the pressure
of life in the spotlight, she makes marriage look easy. How does she do it? Melissa's overriding principle:
Treat your husband like a king! And in return, you'll be treated like a queen!

In Love Italian Style, Melissa shares her (and his) secrets to relationship success-generations-tested old-
fashioned values served up with a modern, sexy twist. To her, the four tenets to a happy marriage are respect,
honesty, loyalty, and passion (underscore passion). By sharing her and Joe's life together-from the story of
their first date to how they still keep it hot in the bedroom a decade later-Melissa admits that, yes, marriage
has been a lot of work, but the rewards are ten-fold. With her time-tested strategies, you can "Gorganize"
your own relationship, strengthen your bond, and amp up the passion for lifelong bliss. Some of Melissa's
how-to's:

· Dress to impress your man.

· Flirt with your hubby.

· Cook Italian style.

· Fight right.

· Keep the romance alive and the home fires burning.

· Raise little princes and princesses.

This playful guidebook promises to make any marriage better-the Gorga way!
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From reader reviews:

Mary Block:

This Love Italian Style: The Secrets of My Hot and Happy Marriage book is absolutely not ordinary book,
you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is definitely information
inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of
information you will get. This particular Love Italian Style: The Secrets of My Hot and Happy Marriage
without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't end
up being worry Love Italian Style: The Secrets of My Hot and Happy Marriage can bring once you are and
not make your carrier space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even
cellphone. This Love Italian Style: The Secrets of My Hot and Happy Marriage having great arrangement in
word and also layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Sara Love:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping Love Italian Style: The Secrets
of My Hot and Happy Marriage that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this
book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world far better then
how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior only for the
geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who want
to start examining as your good habit, you are able to pick Love Italian Style: The Secrets of My Hot and
Happy Marriage become your current starter.

Anna Sanders:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for you is Love Italian Style: The Secrets of My Hot and Happy Marriage this book consist a
lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the
world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer
made some investigation when he makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.

Jacob Hill:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen have to have book to know the up-date information of year to be able to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. By
the book Love Italian Style: The Secrets of My Hot and Happy Marriage we can consider more advantage.



Don't you to be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Just choose the best book
that suitable with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this time book Love Italian Style:
The Secrets of My Hot and Happy Marriage. You can more desirable than now.
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