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This comprehensive handbook designed for the general public, sets forth the structure of the United Nations,
how the Organization works, the main issues it deals with and its importance for people everywhere. Along
with explaining the role played by its principal organs and the family of UN organizations, individual
chapters explore UN contributions to international peace and security, economic and social development,
human rights; humanitarian action, international law; and decolonization. A series of appendices documents
UN membership, peacekeeping operations, budget, and contact information for UN information centers,
services and offices. This new edition of the work has been substantially revised featuring significant
developments worldwide and in the United Nations itself since the last edition (previously titled The UN
Today) in 2008.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Henderson:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Basic Facts about the United Nations 2014. Try to
make book Basic Facts about the United Nations 2014 as your buddy. It means that it can being your friend
when you sense alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned
for you. The book makes you more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So ,
we need to make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Jose Coleman:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading the book, we give you that Basic Facts about the United
Nations 2014 book as beginning and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just
a book.

Donald Freeman:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read a book.
It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day long to
reading a publication. The book Basic Facts about the United Nations 2014 it is very good to read. There are
a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. When you did
not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read
this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides high quality.

Agatha Draper:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source which filled update of news. In
this particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying
to find the Basic Facts about the United Nations 2014 when you necessary it?
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