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The straight-talking, New York Times bestselling author and Pitbull of Personal Development® is back
with a pithy and prescriptive guide to success.
 
A five-time bestselling author and one of the country’s leading business speakers, Larry has made a
reputation for being the first to challenge the positive-attraction gurus and the law-of-attraction bozos with
his commonsense approach to success. Larry doesn’t sugar-coat, and he isn’t afraid to make people
uncomfortable, because he wants us to stop making excuses, and start getting results.
 
In Grow a Pair, Larry takes on entitlement culture, the self-help movement, political correctness, and more.
We’ve all heard the phrase “grow a pair,” but Larry’s advice isn’t about anatomy— it’s about attitude. To get
the success we want, we need to reject victimhood in favor of being assertive and finally taking some
responsibility.
 
With prescriptive advice on goal achieving, career, personal finance, and more, Grow a Pair will give the
readers the kick in the pants they need.
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From reader reviews:

Novella Tinch:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place
and notice by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you that Grow a Pair: How to
Stop Being a Victim and Take Back Your Life, Your Business, and Your Sanity book as beginner and daily
reading book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Gary Ritchie:

The guide with title Grow a Pair: How to Stop Being a Victim and Take Back Your Life, Your Business, and
Your Sanity contains a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this
book. This book exist new understanding the information that exist in this publication represented the
condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This
particular book will bring you inside new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your smart
phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Michael Major:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find publication that need more time to be
learn. Grow a Pair: How to Stop Being a Victim and Take Back Your Life, Your Business, and Your Sanity
can be your answer given it can be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Edward Grimes:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is called of book Grow a Pair:
How to Stop Being a Victim and Take Back Your Life, Your Business, and Your Sanity. Contain your
knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier
to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one destination for a
other place.
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