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The New Testament Validates Torah is a study that all Messianic Believers need, especially in the current
season of considerable growth and expansion in which our broad faith community finds itself. On the whole,
today’s Messianic movement holds that the Torah or the Law of Moses remains valid instruction for God’s
people, and that Yeshua the Messiah (Jesus Christ) did not come to abolish or do away with it (Matthew
5:17-19). Yet throughout much of Christian history, many theologians have argued that the Law has been
rendered inoperative, and/or that it was only to be followed by those in the pre-resurrection era. Many
Messianics are incapable of responding to the common arguments delivered by their Christian family
members, friends, acquaintances, or even various pastors and teachers that they know, who quote verses to
them from the Apostolic Scriptures (New Testament) which supposedly prove that the Law has been “done
away.” Has Moses’ Teaching been abolished? This publication is a lengthy study that analyzes and critically
examines, in detail, a wide number of New Testament passages that are commonly offered as proof texts to
claim that the Torah is not to be followed by those in the post-resurrection era. Statements such as not being
“under the Law” (Romans 6:14-15), “Christ is the end of the Law” (Romans 10:4), “All things are lawful” (1
Corinthians 6:12), “abolishing…the Law of commandments contained in ordinances” (Ephesians 2:15),
“having nailed it to the cross” (Colossians 2:14), and many more, are considered. Considerable attention is
given to the Greek source text of the Apostolic Scriptures, and where translation errors into English appear to
have been made by various modern versions. Cross-examination and discussion with a wide number of
commentators have also been offered, as well as an exploration of important subjects present within today’s
Biblical Studies. The New Testament Validates Torah is an important apologetic study that will benefit
Messianic Believers and evangelical Christians alike. There is literally nothing in today's Messianic
movement that has compiled as much information on Torah relevance for God's people into a single book.
Also, unlike some other publications issued on the message of Torah relevance, The New Testament
Validates Torah is highly respectful to Christian voices over the centuries who have valued what they have
considered to be the "moral law" of the Old Testament, and seeks to honor those who have preceded us in the
faith.
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From reader reviews:

Roger Dupre:

Within other case, little folks like to read book The New Testament Validates Torah: Does the New
Testament Really Do Away With the Law?. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book.
Providing we know about how is important a book The New Testament Validates Torah: Does the New
Testament Really Do Away With the Law?. You can add information and of course you can around the
world with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can learn everything! From your country
until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple point until wonderful thing you are
able to know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or even searching by internet device. It is called e-
book. You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's learn.

Lawanda Beverly:

The book The New Testament Validates Torah: Does the New Testament Really Do Away With the Law?
gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable much more
increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem with the
subject. If you can make studying a book The New Testament Validates Torah: Does the New Testament
Really Do Away With the Law? being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your
current capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know everything if you like
open up and read a reserve The New Testament Validates Torah: Does the New Testament Really Do Away
With the Law?. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals.
So , how do you think about this e-book?

Kenneth Grimes:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could
share their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with
their story or their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their
skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this The
New Testament Validates Torah: Does the New Testament Really Do Away With the Law?.

David Myers:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
lots of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited right.



Then do you try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time,
typically the book you have read will be The New Testament Validates Torah: Does the New Testament
Really Do Away With the Law?.
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