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From A to Z, the Penguin Drop Caps series collects 26 unique hardcovers featuring cover art by type
superstar Jessica Hische

It all begins with a letter. Fall in love with Penguin Drop Caps, a new series of twenty-six collectible and
gift-worthy hardcover editions, each with a type cover showcasing a gorgeously illustrated letter of the
alphabet by superstar type designer Jessica Hische, whose work has appeared everywhere from Tiffany &
Co. to Wes Anderson's film Moonrise Kingdom to Penguin's own bestsellers Committed and Rules of
Civility. A collaboration between Jessica Hische and Penguin Art Director Paul Buckley,  the series design
encompasses foil-stamped paper-over-board cases in a rainbow-hued spectrum across all twenty-six book
spines and a decorative stain on all three paper edges. Penguin Drop Caps debuts with an A for Jane Austen s
Pride and Prejudice, a B for Charlotte Brontë s Jane Eyre, and a C for Willa Cather s My Ántonia, and
continues with more classics from Penguin.

D is for Dickens. The orphan Pip is destined to become a blacksmith like his brother-in-law Joe. But when
Pip meets the beautiful Estella Havisham, he yearns for a gentleman s education in order to woo her. A
mysterious legacy answers his ambition, and changes the course of his life, taking him far from the Marshes
of youth far, so he thinks, from his early terrifying encounter with an escaped convict, and his sister s class
resentments. In this fictional autobiography, Pip s coming-of-age story becomes representative of the
changing social landscape of nineteenth century England. As Pip s education provides upward social
mobility, he must also learn hard lessons about self-delusion and forgiveness, love and loss, and the true
nature of his Great Expectations.
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From reader reviews:

Lawrence Rowe:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be upgrade about what going on or info even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress.
Some of you maybe will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to you is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Great Expectations (Penguin Drop
Caps) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you
want and need in this era.

Patricia Mattox:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
lot of stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity
are you experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly
unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative inside
spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is Great Expectations (Penguin Drop Caps).

Brandon Adams:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book and also novel and Great Expectations (Penguin Drop Caps) or
even others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel need to
read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or even students especially. Those ebooks are
helping them to include their knowledge. In different case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Great
Expectations (Penguin Drop Caps) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this
one.

Christopher Suttle:

A lot of publication has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by means of
searching from it. It is identified as of book Great Expectations (Penguin Drop Caps). You'll be able to your
knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make a person
happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one destination to
other place.
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