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With the award-winning book Agile Software Development: Principles, Patterns, and Practices, Robert C.
Martin helped bring Agile principles to tens of thousands of Java and C++ programmers. Now .NET
programmers have a definitive guide to agile methods with this completely updated volume from Robert C.
Martin and Micah Martin,  Agile Principles, Patterns, and Practices in C#.

This book presents a series of case studies illustrating the fundamentals of Agile development and Agile
design, and moves quickly from UML models to real C# code. The introductory chapters lay out the basics
of the agile movement, while the later chapters show proven techniques in action. The book includes many
source code examples that are also available for download from the authors’ Web site.

Readers will come away from this book understanding

Agile principles, and the fourteen practices of Extreme Programming●

Spiking, splitting, velocity, and planning iterations and releases●

Test-driven development, test-first design, and acceptance testing●

Refactoring with unit testing●

Pair programming●

Agile design and design smells●

The five types of UML diagrams and how to use them effectively●

Object-oriented package design and design patterns●

How to put all of it together for a real-world project●

Whether you are a C# programmer or a Visual Basic or Java programmer learning C#, a software
development manager, or a business analyst,  Agile Principles, Patterns, and Practices in C#  is the first
book you should read to understand agile software and how it applies to programming in the .NET
Framework.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Jones:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Sure, by
reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain than other is high. For you who
want to start reading a book, we give you this particular Agile Principles, Patterns, and Practices in C# book
as beginning and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Neil Owens:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic inside the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to
something different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book could be option to fill
your totally free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should
read. If you want to test look for book, may be the publication untitled Agile Principles, Patterns, and
Practices in C# can be great book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Kim Romero:

You can get this Agile Principles, Patterns, and Practices in C# by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just simply
viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this
reserve are various. Not only by written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the
modern era like now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right
now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Daniel White:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This specific book Agile Principles, Patterns, and Practices in C#
was vibrant and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Agile Principles, Patterns, and
Practices in C# has many kinds or style. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or
Investigation company Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all
of book usually are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best
book in your case and try to like reading in which.
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