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While Confederate blockade runners famously carried the seaborne trade for the South during the American
Civil War, the amount of Southern cotton exported to Europe was only half of that shipped illicitly to the
North. Most went to New England textile mills where business “was better than ever,” according to textile
mogul Amos Lawrence. Rhode Island senator William Sprague, a mill owner and son-in-law to Treasury
Secretary Salmon P. Chase, was a member of a partnership supplying weapons to the Confederacy in
exchange for cotton. The trade in contraband was not confined to New England. Union General William T.
Sherman claimed Confederates were supplied with weapons from Cincinnati, while General Ulysses S. Grant
captured Rebel cavalry armed with carbines purchased in Union-occupied Memphis. During the last months
of the war, supplies entering the Union-controlled port of Norfolk, Virginia, were one of the principal factors
enabling Robert E. Lee’s Confederate army to avoid starvation. Indeed, many of the supplies that passed
through the Union blockade into the Confederacy originated in Northern states, instead of Europe as is
commonly supposed. Merchants were not the only ones who profited; Union officers General Benjamin
Butler and Admiral David Dixon Porter benefited from this black market. President Lincoln admitted that
numerous military leaders and public officials were involved, but refused to stop the trade.
            In Trading with the Enemy: The Covert Economy During the American Civil War, New York Times
Disunion contributor Philip Leigh recounts the little-known story of clandestine commerce between the
North and South. Cotton was so important to the Northern economy that Yankees began growing it on the
captured Sea Islands of South Carolina. Soon the neutral port of Matamoras, Mexico, became a major trading
center, where nearly all the munitions shipped to the port—much of it from Northern armories—went to the
Confederacy. After the fall of New Orleans and Vicksburg, a frenzy of contraband-for-cotton swept across
the vast trans-Mississippi Confederacy, with Northerners sometimes buying the cotton directly from the
Confederate government. A fascinating study, Trading with the Enemy adds another layer to our
understanding of the Civil War.
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From reader reviews:

Josephine Lowe:

With other case, little persons like to read book Trading with the Enemy: The Covert Economy During the
American Civil War (New York Times Disunion). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book.
Providing we know about how is important some sort of book Trading with the Enemy: The Covert
Economy During the American Civil War (New York Times Disunion). You can add knowledge and of
course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can
recognize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple factor
until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or even searching by
internet product. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's go
through.

Jaclyn Utecht:

What do you about book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what your own problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare
time to complete others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have time? What did
you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should answer that question simply because just
their can do that. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper. Because start
from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Trading with the Enemy: The Covert Economy
During the American Civil War (New York Times Disunion) to read.

Shawn Proctor:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you
learn a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your
knowledge, because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what
types of book that you have read. In order to get information about your review, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel,
comics, in addition to soon. The Trading with the Enemy: The Covert Economy During the American Civil
War (New York Times Disunion) will give you a new experience in studying a book.

Donald Edmond:

This Trading with the Enemy: The Covert Economy During the American Civil War (New York Times
Disunion) is completely new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information mainly because it
relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who
still having little bit of digest in reading this Trading with the Enemy: The Covert Economy During the
American Civil War (New York Times Disunion) can be the light food for you personally because the
information inside this specific book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books create itself in the form



which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in reserve form make
them feel sleepy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is not any in reading a reserve especially this
one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss the idea! Just read
this e-book style for your better life and knowledge.
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