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Praise for the First Edition

"The attention to detail is impressive. The book is very well written and the author is extremely
careful with his descriptions . . . the examples are wonderful." —The American Statistician

Fully revised to reflect the latest methodologies and emerging applications, Applied Regression Modeling,
Second Edition continues to highlight the benefits of statistical methods, specifically regression analysis and
modeling, for understanding, analyzing, and interpreting multivariate data in business, science, and social
science applications.

The author utilizes a bounty of real-life examples, case studies, illustrations, and graphics to introduce
readers to the world of regression analysis using various software packages, including R, SPSS, Minitab,
SAS, JMP, and S-PLUS. In a clear and careful writing style, the book introduces modeling extensions that
illustrate more advanced regression techniques, including logistic regression, Poisson regression, discrete
choice models, multilevel models, and Bayesian modeling.

In addition, the Second Edition features clarification and expansion of challenging topics, such as:

Transformations, indicator variables, and interaction●

Testing model assumptions●

Nonconstant variance●

Autocorrelation●

Variable selection methods●

Model building and graphical interpretation●

Throughout the book, datasets and examples have been updated and additional problems are included at the
end of each chapter, allowing readers to test their comprehension of the presented material. In addition, a
related website features the book's datasets, presentation slides, detailed statistical software instructions, and
learning resources including additional problems and instructional videos.

With an intuitive approach that is not heavy on mathematical detail, Applied Regression Modeling, Second
Edition is an excellent book for courses on statistical regression analysis at the upper-undergraduate and
graduate level. The book also serves as a valuable resource for professionals and researchers who utilize
statistical methods for decision-making in their everyday work.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Robinette:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the data
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there
are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their expertise in
writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of them is this Applied
Regression Modeling.

Winford Patterson:

The reserve with title Applied Regression Modeling has a lot of information that you can find out it. You can
get a lot of advantage after read this book. This book exist new information the information that exist in this
publication represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you inside new era of the glowbal growth. You
can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Keith Vanwagoner:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Applied Regression Modeling the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single
aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each and every word
written in a book then become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get
previous to. The Applied Regression Modeling giving you another experience more than blown away your
head but also giving you useful facts for your better life with this era. So now let us explain to you the
relaxing pattern here is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished reading through it,
like winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Pearlie Wong:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Applied Regression Modeling e-book
written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who
else read the book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate
your personal hunger then you still doubt Applied Regression Modeling as good book not just by the cover
but also with the content. This is one reserve that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you still
needing another sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so
why you have to listening to another sixth sense.
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