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The Letters of Vincent van Gogh refers to a collection of 903 surviving letters written (820) or received (83)
by Vincent van Gogh. More than 650 of these were from Vincent to his brother Theo. The collection also
includes letters van Gogh wrote to his sister Wil and other relatives, as well as between artists such as Paul
Gauguin, Anthon van Rappard and Émile Bernard. Vincent's sister-in-law and wife to his brother Theo,
Johanna van Gogh-Bonger, spent many years after her husband's death in 1891 compiling the letters, which
were first published in 1914. Arnold Pomerans, editor of a 1966 selection of the letters, wrote that Theo "was
the kind of man who saved even the smallest scrap of paper", and it is to this trait that we owe the 663 letters
from Vincent. By contrast Vincent infrequently kept letters sent him and just 84 have survived, of which 39
were from Theo. Nevertheless, it is to these letters between the brothers that we owe much of what we know
today about Vincent van Gogh. Indeed, the only period where we are relatively uninformed is the Parisian
period when they shared an apartment and had no need to correspond. The letters effectively play much the
same role in shedding light on the art of the period as those between the de Goncourt brothers did for
literature
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From reader reviews:

John Enriquez:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching
TV, as well as playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look different
you can read any book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole
day to reading a book. The book The Letters of a Post-Impressionist it is extremely good to read. There are a
lot of people who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have
enough space to develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this
book out of your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides high quality.

Loretta Manson:

The Letters of a Post-Impressionist can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We all recommend that
straight away because this book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort that will
put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing The Letters of a Post-Impressionist nevertheless
doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource info that maybe
you can be among it. This great information can certainly drawn you into new stage of crucial pondering.

Florence Williams:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will
get it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This specific The Letters of a Post-Impressionist can give
you a lot of close friends because by you investigating this one book you have issue that they don't and make
you more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer
you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than additional make you to be
great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let me have The Letters of a Post-Impressionist.

Annie Resnick:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is referred to as
of book The Letters of a Post-Impressionist. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the
printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most essential that,
you must aware about book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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