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This is an up-to-date independent study course training manual produced by the Federal Emergency
Management Agency (FEMA) on animals in disasters, module A, awareness and preparedness (IS-10). The
course overview states:

"Why should emergency management officials be concerned with animals in disasters? After all, they are
responsible for the safety of humans, not animals. However, according to the American Veterinary Medical
Association, 58.9 percent of all U.S. households own animals. For this reason, the care of animals in
disasters is important to the care of humans. This course aims to bring together emergency management
officials and the animal-care community to share resources, authority and expertise. This course does not
intend to provide details on the care of animals in disasters, but to promote personal responsibility of animal
owners and care providers. It also guides emergency managers in the recruitment and use of local community
resources to define, develop, teach, and implement a disaster response. Each community must tailor its plan
to meet its own needs. The purpose of this course is two-fold. Module A is intended to increase awareness
and preparedness among animal owners and care providers. It includes sections on typical hazards, how
these affect animals and what can be done by responsible owners to reduce the impact of disasters. It is also
intended to help animal owners, care providers and industries to better understand emergency management.
Module A will heighten awareness of the special issues that emergency managers need to consider when
incorporating animal-care annexes into their emergency operations plans."

Unit 1: Overview. * Unit 2: Introduction. Why are animals an important consideration in disasters? This unit
describes the animal-care community, the societal impact of animal ownership and introduces the concept of
the human-animal bond as a major factor affecting animal owners in disasters. * Unit 3: The four phases of
emergency management. This unit introduces the activities of mitigation, preparedness, response and
recovery and addresses government and individual responsibilities for carrying out these activities. * Units 4
through 6: Defining the risks and applying the four phases of emergency management. * Units 7 and 8: The
care of animals in disasters. * Unit 9: Module A final examination. * Unit 10: Appendices.

This is the complete course manual made available by FEMA as part of the Emergency Management
Institute Independent Study program, described this way by FEMA:

FEMA’s Independent Study Program is one of the delivery channels that the Emergency Management
Institute (EMI) uses to provide training to the general public and specific audiences. Within the Department
of Homeland Security, the Federal Emergency Management Agency, United States Fire Administration,
operates the Emergency Management Institute (EMI). EMI produces independent study courses to train the
general public as well as specific target audiences. The EMI Independent Study program consists of self-
paced courses designed for people who have emergency management responsibilities and the general public.
. .and college credit can be obtained through a for-fee service. Each Independent Study Course includes



lessons with practice exercises and a final examination. Students who score 75 percent or better are issued a
certificate of achievement from EMI. Course completion times vary from two to fourteen hours, depending
on the course and the student’s background.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Haag:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what yours problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have free time?
What did you do? All people has many questions above. They have to answer that question since just their
can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on guardería until university need this specific 21st Century Essential NBC Reference Series:
Animals in Disaster Module A, Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) Independent Study
Course Manual ... Destruction WMD, First Responder Ringbound) to read.

Mary Fleming:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their family, or
their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic inside the
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill your
free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday. The
first thing you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to consider look
for book, may be the reserve untitled 21st Century Essential NBC Reference Series: Animals in Disaster
Module A, Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) Independent Study Course Manual ...
Destruction WMD, First Responder Ringbound) can be good book to read. May be it may be best activity to
you.

George Chadwick:

The book 21st Century Essential NBC Reference Series: Animals in Disaster Module A, Federal Emergency
Management Agency (FEMA) Independent Study Course Manual ... Destruction WMD, First Responder
Ringbound) has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of
advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research before
write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can find the point easily after perusing this book.

Joan James:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This book 21st Century Essential NBC Reference Series:
Animals in Disaster Module A, Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) Independent Study
Course Manual ... Destruction WMD, First Responder Ringbound) was colorful and of course has pictures
around. As we know that book 21st Century Essential NBC Reference Series: Animals in Disaster Module
A, Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) Independent Study Course Manual ... Destruction
WMD, First Responder Ringbound) has many kinds or style. Start from kids until youngsters. For example



Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book
usually are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book
in your case and try to like reading which.
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