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The bestselling project management text for students and professionals—now updated and expanded

This Eleventh Edition of the bestselling "bible" of project management maintains the streamlined approach
of the prior editions and moves the content even closer to PMI's Project Management Body of Knowledge
(PMBOK). New content has been added to this edition on measuring project management ROI, value to the
organization and to customers, and much more. The capstone "super" case on the "Iridium Project" has been
maintained, covering all aspects of project management. Increased use of sidebars throughout the book helps
further align it with the PMBOK and the Project Management Professional (PMP) Certification Exam.

This new edition features significant expansion, including more than three dozen entirely new sections and
updates on process supporting; types of project closure; project sponsorship; and culture, teamwork, and
trust. This comprehensive guide to the principles and practices of project management:

Offers new sections on added value, business intelligence, project governance, and much more●

Provides twenty-five case studies covering a variety of industries, almost all of which are real-world●

situations drawn from the author's practice
Includes 400 discussion questions and more than 125 multiple-choice questions●

Serves as an excellent study guide for the PMP Certification Exam●
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From reader reviews:

Ruth McMillian:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they're still students or this for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great along with important the book Project Management: A
Systems Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling. All type of book are you able to see on many
sources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Richard Cassidy:

Here thing why this specific Project Management: A Systems Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and
Controlling are different and trusted to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good nevertheless it depends
in the content of computer which is the content is as scrumptious as food or not. Project Management: A
Systems Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling giving you information deeper and different
ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no e-book that similar with Project Management: A
Systems Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up
your own eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is probably can be happened around
you. You can actually bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your approach home by train.
Should you be having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Project Management: A
Systems Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling in e-book can be your option.

Christopher Thompson:

The reserve untitled Project Management: A Systems Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling is
the book that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to
you actually. The language that article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The copy writer was did a lot of research when write the book, and so the information that they
share for you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of Project Management: A Systems
Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free
time.

Charles Steen:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, short story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not striving Project Management: A Systems
Approach to Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling that give your fun preference will be satisfied by reading
this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world
better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior only
for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for every you who want



to start reading as your good habit, you are able to pick Project Management: A Systems Approach to
Planning, Scheduling, and Controlling become your own starter.
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