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The Canadian health care system is so indisputably tied to our national identity that its founder, Tommy
Douglas, was voted the greatest Canadian of all time in a CBC television contest. However, very little has
been written to date on how Medicare as we know it was developed and implemented. This collection fills a
serious gap in the existing literature by providing a comprehensive policy history of Medicare in Canada.

Making Medicare features explorations of the experiments that predated the federal government’s decision to
implement the Saskatchewan health care model, from Newfoundland’s cottage hospital system to
Bennettcare in British Columbia. It also includes essays by key individuals (including health practitioners
and two premiers) who played a role in the implementation of Medicare and the landmark Royal
Commission on Health Services. Along with political scientists, policy specialists, medical historians, and
health practitioners, this collection will appeal to anyone interested in the history and legacy of one of
Canada’s most visible and centrally important institutions.
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From reader reviews:

Betty Terry:

Within other case, little folks like to read book Making Medicare: New Perspectives on the History of
Medicare in Canada (Institute of Public Administration of Canada Series in Public Management and
Governance). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know about how is
important a new book Making Medicare: New Perspectives on the History of Medicare in Canada (Institute
of Public Administration of Canada Series in Public Management and Governance). You can add know-how
and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can know
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple thing until wonderful
thing you may know that. In this era, we could open a book or perhaps searching by internet system. It is
called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Jeffrey Peak:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they're still students or that for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Making Medicare: New
Perspectives on the History of Medicare in Canada (Institute of Public Administration of Canada Series in
Public Management and Governance). All type of book can you see on many methods. You can look for the
internet methods or other social media.

Jonathan Solis:

The book Making Medicare: New Perspectives on the History of Medicare in Canada (Institute of Public
Administration of Canada Series in Public Management and Governance) will bring you to the new
experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In case you try
to find new book to read, this book very suited to you. The book Making Medicare: New Perspectives on the
History of Medicare in Canada (Institute of Public Administration of Canada Series in Public Management
and Governance) is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from the official web site,
so you can easier to read the book.

Johnnie Gonzales:

Beside this kind of Making Medicare: New Perspectives on the History of Medicare in Canada (Institute of
Public Administration of Canada Series in Public Management and Governance) in your phone, it might give
you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here
is fresh from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow village. It is good
thing to have Making Medicare: New Perspectives on the History of Medicare in Canada (Institute of Public



Administration of Canada Series in Public Management and Governance) because this book offers to you
personally readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you would not get what it's interesting
features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable option here
cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the item? Find this
book along with read it from at this point!
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