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This book provides an extensive literary analysis of the Gideon, Abimelech and Jephthah narratives in
Judges 6-12, and discloses the main intention of these stories. The book consists of three chapters, each of
which analyses the respective biblical narratives. These narratives show the two parameters by which the
Israelite leaders are examined, namely their loyalty to God and their altruistic character: A leader who
prefers his own interest is doomed to his own demise and brings devastation upon his people. Judges does
not establish a preferred governmental model, instead it considers the advantages and disadvantages of the
different types of regimes. In the epilogue it is suggested that these narratives are conveniently placed in the
pre-monarchic period when the question of the regime becomes part of the political debate. The book of
Judges offers criteria for the choice of the right leader.

Readership: The book will engage those interested in biblical narrative and particularly in the Book of
Judges, as well as those who have an interest in synchronic readings with an eye toward their underlying
ideologies.
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From reader reviews:

William Bellard:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they take because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or
even exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Self-Interest or Communal Interest: An Ideology of Leadership
in the Gideon, Abimelech and Jephthah Narratives (Judg 6-12) (Supplements to Vetus Testamentum 106).

Candice Foushee:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book Self-Interest or Communal Interest: An
Ideology of Leadership in the Gideon, Abimelech and Jephthah Narratives (Judg 6-12) (Supplements to
Vetus Testamentum 106) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can
know about everything. But some of you think which open or reading a new book make you bored. It is far
from make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suited book
with you?

Sheila Seim:

This Self-Interest or Communal Interest: An Ideology of Leadership in the Gideon, Abimelech and Jephthah
Narratives (Judg 6-12) (Supplements to Vetus Testamentum 106) is great guide for you because the content
that is full of information for you who always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute.
This kind of book reveal it info accurately using great manage word or we can claim no rambling sentences
in it. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only
provides you with straight forward sentences but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences.
Having Self-Interest or Communal Interest: An Ideology of Leadership in the Gideon, Abimelech and
Jephthah Narratives (Judg 6-12) (Supplements to Vetus Testamentum 106) in your hand like obtaining the
world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no publication that offer you world
throughout ten or fifteen tiny right but this reserve already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hi
Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt this?

Harold Singleton:

A lot of guide has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is identified



as of book Self-Interest or Communal Interest: An Ideology of Leadership in the Gideon, Abimelech and
Jephthah Narratives (Judg 6-12) (Supplements to Vetus Testamentum 106). Contain your knowledge by it.
Without making the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most
critical that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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